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712-336-1205 
krowley@co.dickinson.ia.us  
 
The county treasurer’s office will open up along with the rest of the Dickinson County 
Courthouse by appointment only.  The expected opening date is Wednesday, June 3rd.   
Dickinson County Treasurer Kris Rowley says, “Governor Reynolds extended the 
Proclamation of Public Health Disaster Emergency to June 25, 2020.  If the proclamation 
is not further extended, here’s deadlines to be aware of.” 
 
1.  Property taxes:  Pay by June 25, 2020 to avoid delinquent interest charges.  No 
appointments will be available for property tax payments.  Pay online at 
www.IowaTaxAndTags.org, by mail at Dickinson County Treasurer; PO Box AD; Spirit 
Lake, IA 51360; by phone at 712-336-1205; or use the Dickinson County Treasurer drop 
box on the west side of the Courthouse, outside the front door.   
 
2.  Motor Vehicle Transactions:  If your vehicle registration expired January 31, 2020 
or later, it will be considered valid to drive in the state of Iowa until June 25, 2020 
without penalty.  You can pay these online or by mail to remain current. The 30-day 
deadline to transfer a vehicle purchased on or after February 13, 2020 was suspended 
until the proclamation expires, currently June 25, 2020.  The 45-day deadline for driving 
with temp plates on vehicles purchased on or after January 31, 2020 was suspended until 
the proclamation expires as well.  Contact the treasurer’s office for more information at 
712-336-1205. 
 
3.  Driver’s License Transactions:  If your driver’s license expired on or after January 
16, 2020, until the COVID-19 disaster is lifted by Iowa Governor Reynolds, currently 
June 25, 2020, your license/ID will remain valid to drive in the state of Iowa.  You may 
be able to renew online or qualify for a 6-month extension on your current license.  
Contact us at 712-336-6277 for more information. 
 
Rowley says, “We’re here to help you with your property tax, motor vehicle and driver’s 
license needs throughout the COVID-19 disaster.  The website for Dickinson County is 
https://dickinsoncountyiowa.org.  There are links to the Iowa Tax and Tags website, 
www.IowaTaxAndTags.org, for making property tax and motor vehicle renewal 
payments.  If you have questions, call the treasurer’s office at 712-336-1205 or email the 
treasurer at krowley@co.dickinson.ia.us.   
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